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The Editorial Board and staff would like to 
thank the authors and readers of SKIN: The 
Journal of Cutaneous Medicine for helping 
the journal reach more than 1 million reads. 
Since its founding in 2017, SKIN has been 
dedicated to providing an enhanced route to 
disseminating new dermatologic knowledge 
covering all aspects of cutaneous disease. 
We are grateful to all of the authors and 
contributors for making each issue over the 
past six years educational and informative. 
We would also like to thank the entire 
dermatologic and broader medical 
community for the submission of articles to 
SKIN and for trusting the journal as a source 
of new and important dermatologic 
information. 
 
Publication of this journal would not be 
possible without the support and sponsorship 
of the National Society for Cutaneous 
Medicine, as well as the previous managing 
editors over the past six years (Nicholas 
Brownstone, MD, Justin Marson, MD, 
Graham Litchman, DO, MS, Ryan Svoboda, 
MD, MS, Alex Glazer, MD, and Aaron 
Farberg, MD). SKIN is committed to making 

its literature available to all and to maintaining 
authors' publishing abilities without any cost. 
Our team continues to be devoted to rapidly 
publishing high-quality articles on a wide 
variety of topics within the field of 
dermatology and we look forward to doing so 
for many years to come. 
 
 
 
		


